
$299,900 - 26 Mallard Street, Ridgeland
MLS #191290 

$299,900
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,445 sqft
Residential on 1.38 Acres

Tarboro, Ridgeland, SC

PRICE REDUCTION!! Priced to sell, don't
miss this incredible opportunity! This charming
3-4 bedroom cottage-style home sits on a
spacious 1.38-acre corner lot in a peaceful
neighborhood. 4th bedroom has been
converted into a fantastic laundry/utility room
but could easily be used as a small bedroom
or office. Enjoy a bright kitchen & dining area
that opens to a beautiful screened-in
porchâ€”perfect for relaxing or entertaining
year round. The master bathroom features his
and her sinks, a shower & a walk-in closet!
Outside, enjoy a partially fenced backyard
that's perfect for pets, plus two outbuildings for
extra storage or workshop space. Minutes to
town, I-95, & close to Beaufort, Bluffton, &
Savannah. With so much to offer and priced to
move this won't last long! Come tour today and
make an offer!

Built in 1976

Essential Information

MLS # 191290

Price $299,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,445

Acres 1.38

Year Built 1976



Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Ranch

Status Active

Community Information

Address 26 Mallard Street

Area Ridgeland

Subdivision Tarboro

City Ridgeland

County Jasper

State SC

Zip Code 29936

Amenities

Waterfront None

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Elec/Oven/Range, Refrigerator

Heating Electric, Central, Heat Pump

Cooling Electric, Central Air

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Board/Batten

Exterior Features Storage

Roof Composition

Construction Brick, Board/Batten

Additional Information

Zoning Residential

Listing Details

Listing Agent Gabriela Padron

Listing Office Mi Casa Real Estate, LLC
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