
$279,900 - 127 John Glenn Drive, Rincon
MLS #SA338827 

$279,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,350 sqft
Residential

Westwood Heights, Rincon, GA

Welcome to 127 John Glenn Drive! This
charming all-brick, NO HOA, 3-bedroom,
2-bath home is completely move-in ready and
offers the perfect blend of comfort and
convenience. Inside, youâ€™ll find a light and
airy layout featuring fresh paint throughout, a
cozy wood-burning fireplace, and carpet
limited to the bedrooms. The ownerâ€™s suite
includes a soaking tub and separate shower.
Step outside to enjoy the large, private lot from
the covered back patioâ€”ideal for entertaining
or quiet evenings at home. A storage shed
provides additional space for lawn equipment
and tools. Conveniently located near
shopping, dining, and exactly 5 minutes to
Blandford Elementary School, this home is a
must-see.  Conveniently located to I-95, the
airport and the home is 10 miles to Gulfstream
Aerospace.

Built in 1994

Essential Information

MLS # SA338827

Price $279,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,350

Year Built 1994

Type Residential



Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Ranch

Status Active

Community Information

Address 127 John Glenn Drive

Subdivision Westwood Heights

City Rincon

County Effingham

State GA

Zip Code 31326

Amenities

Utilities Cable Available, Underground Utilities

Features Back Yard, Private, Wooded

Parking Parking Available

Garages Parking Available

Interior

Interior Features Breakfast Area, Double Vanity, Garden Tub/Roman Tub, Main Level
Primary, Pantry, Pull Down Attic Stairs, Separate Shower, Fireplace

Appliances Dishwasher, Electric Water Heater, Oven, Range, Self Cleaning Oven

Heating Central, Electric

Cooling Central Air, Electric

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Family Room, Wood Burning

# of Stories 1

Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Brick

Exterior Features Covered Patio

Lot Description Back Yard, Private, Wooded

Construction Brick

Foundation Slab

School Information

Elementary Blandford



Middle Ebenezer

High South Effingham

Additional Information

Date Listed September 2nd, 2025

Zoning AR-1

Listing Details

Listing Agent Jill J. Sapp

Listing Office Better Homes and Gardens Real
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